
                                                                                           
 

Jakson Green emerges as the fastest utility-scale 
renewable EPC company with over 1 GW orders 

• Company has won marquee large scale renewable EPC deals in Africa & 
Middle-East regions 

• Includes an EPC order to construct the single largest C&I solar park in India 
from one of the world’s leading renewable energy asset managers 

New Delhi, India, April 11, 2023: Jakson Green, backed by the India headquartered 

infrastructure and renewables major Jakson Group, has announced today that it has 

secured over 1 GW of renewable EPC orders across India, Africa, and the Middle East 

regions within a record time. 

Jakson Green has won EPC projects with leading renewable power producers in the 

Middle East for projects in GCC and Africa regions, in addition to its impressive 

renewable EPC orders in India, including a recent deal with one of the world’s leading 

renewable energy asset managers to build India’s largest C&I solar park in Bikaner, 

Rajasthan. Globally, the company is also set to deliver large-scale energy storage 

turnkey EPC co-located with some of the aforementioned projects. 

In a short span, the company has created a remarkable and unique order book within 

the green hydrogen and new energies EPC business, with projects catering to several 

applications ranging from the displacement of grey hydrogen with green hydrogen at 

process plants to the production of methanol from flue gas CO2 and hydrogen-for-

mobility applications. 

Speaking on the occasion, Mr. Bikesh Ogra, Managing Director & CEO of Jakson 

Green, said, “We are extremely humbled and delighted by the faith and trust shown 

by our clients in the solar, energy storage, and hydrogen and new energies space, as 

evidenced by the impressive global order book we have secured since inception. With 

over a GW under our wings, we have emerged as one of the world’s fastest-growing 

utility-scale renewable EPCs. We are confident of working with all our clients to deliver 

world-class projects adhering to high safety and quality benchmarks, riding on the 

back of our globally proven execution expertise in large-scale renewable energy 

projects. We would like to thank all our employees, partners, and clients for this 

success and look forward to building upon this momentum.” 

Jakson Green has recently announced its global ambitions to be a leading developer 
and integrator of green hydrogen and green ammonia assets across select 
geographies and is eyeing a play in the independent hydrogen and ammonia 
production and electrolyser manufacturing space in line with Hon’ble Prime Minister 
Shri Narendra Modi’s vision of Atmanirbhar Bharat. The firm is actively developing a 
pipeline of renewable energy, green hydrogen, and green ammonia projects, both in 
India and abroad. 
 
 
 



                                                                                           
 

ABOUT JAKSON GREEN: 
 
Jakson Green, a new energy transition platform backed by India headquartered 
Infrastructure and Renewable major, Jakson Group, focusses on EPC, IPP, IHP and 
O&M of new energy assets spanning solar, utility-scale storage, waste-to-energy, fuel 
cell technologies, gasification-based projects, green hydrogen, and green ammonia 
projects. Promoted and led by Bikesh Ogra, a renewable sector veteran with over 
10GW of experience across 26 countries, the firm has built up an impressive global 
presence in a short span since its inception and plans to deliver 5GW renewable 
energy assets by 2025 and 10GW by 2030. The firm plans to enter the electrolyser 
manufacturing space, besides building and operating green hydrogen assets globally, 
in line with its vision of being a power-to-X player cumulatively producing over 0.5 
million tons per annum of green hydrogen/ammonia by 2030. 
 
ABOUT JAKSON GROUP: 
 
Established in the year 1947, the Jakson Group has diversified from a conventional 
energy products manufacturer into a fully-integrated energy solutions company, 
providing expertise in the fields of solar power, battery energy storage system, 
distributed energy & solar, and electrical EPC. The company has an extensive 
presence throughout India with 4 manufacturing facilities, 30+ Sales Offices, and a 
wide network of channel partners and dealers making it one of the top 10 energy 
companies in India. The company emphasises on providing superior quality products 
and offers the most viable & cost-effective solutions to its clients backed by the long-
standing expertise in the Energy Industry.  For more information on the company, 
please visit   www.jakson.com  
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